


Reena
Nursing Student

To serve the 
poor people 
in the sluv 

area

I am Reena, pursuing 2nd year Nursing
Diploma course in Royal College. My
mother Regina Mary is working as a
housemaid and my father Jeyaseelan is
working as a security guard. My
younger brother named Jabeson, is
studying in 9th standard in CBM School.

I am studying well. My ambition is to
become a nurse. My father is having
heart problem, so he can not do hard
work to earn money. sometimes he
becomes sick and cannot go to work.
During that time, only with my mother’s
income we have to meet all our daily
needs. In my family most of them are
sick people, so from my childhood I
decided to become an nurse and serve
the poor people help in my area.

Everyday I am praying for you & for
your family. Please remember us in your
prayers.

I thank you so much for your support
towards my education.



Evangelin Rubah
Student

Your help 
brightened 
vy future

I am Joyce, working as a saleswomen in
a department store. I have two beautiful
daughters. This year my elder daughter
has completed 12th standard and my
younger daughter is studying 11th
standard in RKV Matriculation School.

Before 12 years my husband
abandoned me and my children. Till
today I am the only person taking care
of them and my monthly salary is Rs.
6000.
My elder daughter has secured 1056
marks out of 1200 in her 12th standard
government examination. Now she is
going to join college for her higher
studies. So your help will be very useful
for her studies. I was worried about her
education fees but by the grace of God
you have helped my daughter for her
higher studies. Your support is a great
blessing to us in this needful time. Thank
you.



Praisy
Accountancy Student

Teach the 
needy 

people @ 
free of cost 

“I am Christopher Johnson working as
reporting assistance in IPA office. My
wife Vidhya Johnson is a house wife. My
mother and my wife’s mother is staying
with us.
God has blessed me with two sweet
daughters, elder one Blessy has
completed B.E., Electronics and
Communication and now she is searching
for job and younger one Praisy is
pursuing B. Com 2nd year in Nirmala
college. She scored good marks in her
first year and she is also interested in
sports and cultural programmes. Her
ambition is to get a bank job.
I write this letter to thank you for the
help that you have granted for my
daughter’s higher studies. I will never
forget your help and we as a family
pray for you. I request you to pray for
her studies and that she should achieve
something great, so that our saviors
name will be exalted. Kindly pray for
us. Thank you.



Sandy Dania
School Student

Thank you 
for always 
being there 
for ve…

I am Stephen, working as an Office
Assistant in Indian Pentecostal
Assemblies office and my wife Sheela is
a housewife. I am blessed with two
daughters.

My eldest daughter named Sandy
Dania is studying in 3rd standard in GVK
School and she has got 1st Prize in the
running race competition. She is very
much interested to learn dance and
keyboard. My younger daughter named
Rachel Dania is studying in UKG in
Nirmal Matha Convent School.

My younger daughter’s ambition is to
become a police officer. Her favorite
subject is English. She likes to draw
pictures. She likes to play with her sister
and friends. Thank you so much for your
help towards my daughter education.

Kindly remember us in your prayers.
Thank you.



Sam Peter
Accountancy Student

I sow good 
and good 
will cove 

back to ve

I am Sam Peter, studying in 2nd year
B.com in Karunya University. My father
and my mother are running a small
tailor shop. My parents business is a
seasonal business, sometime it will be
very dull.

I am studying well. I like to become an
chartered accountant. It is a very tuff
subject but I am working hard to achieve
my ambition.

My hobbies are playing football and
listening to music. Now a days I am
going to guitar class and learning to
play guitar. In my free time I am
working as a volunteer in our church.

Your help is very useful for my studies.
Your help is reducing my parents burden
and boosts me up to achieve my
ambition.



R. Daniel
School Student

Willing to 
protect the 
nation frov 
the terrorist

I am Greeta working as a Senior
Accountant in IPA office. My husband is
working in a lathe workshop and his
income is low because of economic crises
in our country. God has blessed us with
two sons named Gabriel & Daniel.

My elder son Gabriel finished his final
year B. Tech Mechanical Engineering in
the month of June 2017 and my younger
son Daniel is studying in 10th standard in
Bharathi Matriculation Higher Secondary
School. He is studying well. This year he
is going to write government
examination, so he is going for tuition
and thus preparing himself well for the
examination. His ambition is to become
an Army soldier.

I thank you so much for the help that you
have granted for my son. Please
remember my family in your prayers,
especially Daniel for his government
examination to score more marks. Thank
you.



G. Joshuva Prakasam
Student

Thanks a 
lot…

Thank you so 
vuch…

I am Joshua Prakasam doing 2nd year
B.A., English Literature. My Father
Gnana Prakasam and my mother Dorthy
are ministering for God.

My favourite subject is English, that’s
why I have chosen BA., English Literature.
I love to study. And through this course I
am learning a lot of new things.

This month we had little rain, so in our
place paddy cultivation is going on. And
it will be very interesting to watch the
harvest.

Your help is very useful for my studies.
Thank you so much for the help that you
are doing for me. Thanks a lot.



Rachel
School Student

You have 
enlightened 

vy life

I am Rachel studying in 10th standard in
RKV Matriculation Higher Secondary
School. My school is located nearby my
house. I go to school by walk, it is just 10
minutes walk from my house. My father
is doing business and my mother is the
warden in Bethel Children Home,
Kovaipudur. I have one elder brother
Manovah, he is studying B.com 2nd year.

Badminton is my favorite game. Science
& social science are my favorite subjects.
I got many prizes and certificates in
badminton. I am regularly going to
church.

I thank you so much for all the help that
you are doing for my education. It is
useful for my life. Thank you.



Thirisal
School Student

Serve the 
lord with full 

strength

I am Babu, doing ministry in a Hill tribe
village area. Myself and my wife are
doing ministry. By the grace of God we
are doing good and the ministry is
going on well because the village is not
so open for gospel. Our lord is leading
us in a prefect way.

I have two children, elder daughter
named Thirisal is studying in
6th standard in Madane higher
Secondary School and my younger son
named Thirusanth is studying in LEF
School. My daughter is studying well.
Her ambition is to become a teacher.
Her favorite subject is English. She is
studying well. We always remember you
and your family in our personal prayer
time.

I thank you so much for the help that you
are doing for my daughter’s education.
Your help is very useful for us in our
needy time.


